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MEMORANDUM 
 
 
 
October 25, 2022 

 
 
 

To:  Sheila Jones, Supervisor, District I 
     Trey Baxter, Supervisor, District II 
     Gerald Steen, Supervisor, District III 
    Karl Banks, Supervisor, District IV 
    Paul Griffin, Supervisor, District V 

 
 

From:  Tim Bryan, P.E., PTOE 
        County Engineer  
 
 

Re: Request for Payment 
 Project: Reunion Parkway Phase II 
 Parcel: 003-00-00-W/003-00-00-T-001 
 
 

The Engineering Department recommends that the Board accept the invoice for $2,000.00 for the 
acquisition of right of way for Reunion Parkway Phase II Project from C.A. Hall III and Nancy K. Hall 
and Hall Land Company, L.P. to authorize the Comptroller to issue the check.  
 
Check payment to: 
 
Payee:  
 

Nancy K. Hall   $2,000.00 
 P. O. Box 12266  

Jackson, MS  39236 
 
  
 
   



 

 

Integrated Right of Way  
P. O. Box 3066 
Madison MS, 39130  
Phone: 601-790-0443 

 
 Right of Way Acquisition Closing Statement 

Supplement – Final Closing Statement 

Project Reunion Parkway Phase II Parcel 

County Madison 

Owners C.A. Hall, III and Nancy K. Hall              Address 

 and Hall Land Company, L.P         

003-00-00-W / 003-00-00-T-001 
 
 
P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236 

 
 
Total Payment Due 
Land: 
Damages: 
Administrative Adjustment: 
Total: 

$4,200.00  
$0.00  
$3,800.00  
$8,000.00 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Pay Distribution to Date: 
Hall Land Company, L.P P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236     $4,000.00  - Previously Paid 
Nancy K. Hall P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236     $2,000.00  - Previously Paid 
 
Final Payment Due 
Nancy K. Hall  
P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236     $2,000.00  
 
 

Date: 10/ 25/22  

Authorized Acquisition Agent: 

 

Greg M. Thompson 
 



 

 

Integrated Right of Way  
P. O. Box 3066 
Madison MS, 39130  
Phone: 601-790-0443 

 
 Right of Way Acquisition Closing Statement 

Project Reunion Parkway Phase II Parcel 

County Madison 

Owners C.A. Hall, III and Nancy K. Hall              Address 

 and Hall Land Company, L.P         

003-00-00-W / 003-00-00-T-001 
 
 
P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236 

 
Payment Due 
Land: 
Damages: 
Administrative Adjustment: 
Total: 

$4,200.00  
$0.00  
$3,800.00  
$8,000.00 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Pay Distribution: 
Hall Land Company, L.P P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236     $4,000.00  
Nancy K. Hall P.O. Box 12266 
Jackson, MS 39236     $2,000.00  

C.A. Hall, III Estate     $2,000.00 
*DO NOT MAIL CHECK.  NO w-9 ON FILE.  iROW will send w-9 at a later date for payment of this 
portion.  
 
Included herein: 

• Initialized FMVO 
• Properly executed warranty deed 
• Right of Way Plat Maps 
• Land Owner Counter Offer approval 

1. Properly Executed Warranty Deeds & Temporary Easements Properly Executed W-9All considerations agreed on by the above-

named Owner(s) and the Right of Way Agent signing this statement are embodied in the instrument of conveyance, there 

being no oral agreements or representations of any kind. 

2. The considerations embodied in this instrument of conveyance on the abovementioned project and parcel number were reach 

without coercion, promises other than those shown in the agreement, or threats of any kind whatsoever by or to either party whose 

name appears on this instrument. 

3. The undersigned Right of Way Agent has no direct or indirect, present or contemplated future personal interest in the 

abovementioned parcels nor will in any way benefit from the acquisition of such property. 

Date: 5 /10/22  

Authorized Acquisition Agent: 

 

Greg M. Thompson 
 































Tuesday, May 10, 2022 at 11:01:04 AM Central Daylight Time

Page 1 of 1

Subject: right of way checks
Date: Tuesday, May 10, 2022 at 9:59:35 AM Central Daylight Time
From: khall@majesDcmetalsinc.com <khall@majesDcmetalsinc.com>
To: Greg Thompson <gthompson@irow.ms>

Good morning,
 
I need the checks made out to:
 
CA Hall III estate $2000.00
Nancy K. Hall $2000.00
Hall Land Company $4000.00
 
Thanks,
 
Kiley




